ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF KETCHUM, IDAHO,
REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 1079 AND
REPLACING CHAPTER 15.04, BUILDING CODES, OF THE KEHUM MUNICIPAL
CODE, ITS ENTIRETY AND
ADOPTING THE 2012 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUIDING CODE,
INCLUDING APPENDICES A, B, C, E, G, | AND J, AND RAESED SECTION 903 AS
MODIFIED HEREIN, AND EXCLUDING SECTION 101.4.3 (PLMBING); ADOPTING THE
2012 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, PARTS | THROUB IV AND PART IX
INCLUDING APPENDIX D, E, F, G, H, J, K, M; THE 20INTERNATIONAL ENERGY
CONSERVATION CODE; THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL EXISTINGUILDING CODE;
AND THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE COB; PUBLISHED BY
THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL, AS AMENDED HEREINAS THE OFFICIAL
CODES FOR SAID CITY, REGULATING ALL BUILDING AND ENERGY
CONSERVATION AS DEFINED IN THE SCOPE OF THE CODEHEROVIDING FOR
ENFORCEMENT AND PENALTIES; PROVIDING A SAVINGS ANBEVERABILITY
CLAUSE; PROVIDING A CODIFICATION CLAUSE; PROVIDINGA REPEALER CLAUSE;
PROVIDING FOR PUBLICATION BY SUMMARY; AND PROVIDINGFOR AN
EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, the City of Ketchum has adopted the Iragamal series of codes, including the
International Building, Residential, Energy Consgion, Existing Building, Property
Maintenance and Fire Codes;

WHEREAS, the Idaho Building Code Act requires thgy@Gdopt the 2012 versions of the
International Building Code as determined by trehinl Building Code Board and the City desires
to adopt such Code;

WHEREAS, pursuant to Idaho Code 39-4116, the GCityempowered to amend the 2012
International series of codes to reflect local @ns;

WHEREAS, the City has determined that good causstsexo amend the 2012 International
Building (IBC), Residential (IRC), Energy Conseivat (IECC), Existing Building (IEBC),
Property Maintenance (IPMC) and Fire (IFC) Codesl auch amendment is reasonably
necessary;

WHEREAS, the City of Ketchum has made a commitmenpreserving the environmental
guality of the region through participation in egerinitiatives, resource conservation in City
buildings, encouraging water conservation by itszens and educational outreach to the
community;

WHEREAS, codes have evolved in recent years tolaggunot only immediate life safety

hazards, but also a larger set of hazards cregtduebcumulative impacts of buildings on human
and environmental health;

ORDINANCE NO. pr?? 1 November 13, 2014




WHEREAS, buildings use the most energy (40%) of sewtor in the United States, therefore it
makes sense to curtail impact where it is greatest;

WHEREAS, Ketchum'’s climate results in high heatiogd and large energy consumption, which
provides an opportunity to conserve large amouingmiergy and to save resources and money;

WHEREAS, in the United States, buildings use 14%pofable water consumption, and in
Ketchum’'s dry, high desert climate, it is prudent dtrive to conserve water for a better
environment;

WHEREAS, exterior energy consumption has to daém lb@gely unregulated, and exterior energy
conservation represents a great opportunity tonltegieduce/mitigate that energy use;

WHEREAS, a 2010 McGraw Hill study found that théura on investment of energy efficient
buildings, mainly from avoided electricity or hewgi costs, is nearly 10% higher than for
conventional new buildings and 19% higher for rigsp

WHEREAS, the Idaho Residential Cost Analysis fof@@2 IECC to 2012 study shows that 2012
IECC compliance results in about a 25% reductioeniergy costs, which has a conservative simple
payback period of six years;

WHEREAS, the 2013 Idaho Homeowner Survey on Endtfficiency showed that 65% of
Idahoans support energy codes to promote enerigieetty; and

WHEREAS, the Fire Chief recommends enhanced figgarsgion in two- and multi-family
dwellings to increase life safety for the occupamig fire fighters;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Mayor and @au of the City of
Ketchum, Idaho that Ordinance No. s herepgakted in its entirety and that Chapter 15.04,
International and Uniform Codes Adopted, of thedkeim Municipal Code, is hereby replaced in
its entirety with the following:

Section 1. Section 15.04.010 of the Ketchum Municipal Codaaseby replaced in
its entirety with the following:

15.04.10 International and Uniform Codes Adopted.

The following International Codes as amended heaeghadopted by reference by the City of
Ketchum, Idaho:

(@8  The International Building Code, 2012 Edition, inting appendices A, B, C, E, G, | and
J, excluding Section 101.4.3;

(b) The International Residential Code, 2012 Editiomyt® | through IV and Part IX
including appendices D, E, F, G, H, J, Kand M;

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 2 November 13, 2014




(c) The International Energy Conservation Code 22Bdition, including the appendix;
(d) The International Existing Building Code, 2CEdition; and,
(e) The International Property Maintenance Codé22Bdition.

Copies of the five International Codes listed abareon file and are open to public inspection in
the office of the building official of the City d¢etchum, Idaho.

Section 2.  Section 15.04.020, Amendments, of the Ketchum MpalcCode, is
hereby replaced with the following:

15.04.020 Amendments

15.04.020(A) Amendments to the International Buildig Code
(@  Section 101.1 Insert: [City of Ketchum, Idaho]

(b)  Section 1612.3 Insert: [City of Ketchum, Idaho]rjéub, 1978]
(c) Section 3412.2 Insert: [January 1, 1975]

(d) Sections 109.2 of said Code is amended to reaollas/s:

109.2 Schedule of permit fees.

On buildings and structures or alterations reqgianpermit, a fee for each permit shall
be paid as required, in accordance with the scleedsl set forth in Table 1-A as
established by resolution (###?) of the City ofdftetm.

(e) Section 104.10.1 of said Code is amended thasdollows:

104.10.1 Flood hazard areas.

The building official shall not grant modificatiorte any provision required ifiood
hazard areas as established by Section 1612.3 unless a vartzaxdeen approved by the
planning and zoning commission.

) Said Code is amended by adding new Sections 11, and 119 as follows:

SECTION 117 - INDEMNITY. Every person, firm or corporation to whom pernussi
has been granted under the terms of this Codehengdeneral ordinances to utilize public
property for the demolition work or the moving ofyabuilding, structure or utility, shall
at all times assume full responsibility for suchmadition or moving. Such permission
shall be further conditioned for the use of pulgioperty to at all times release, hold
harmless and indemnify the City of Ketchum andéits agents and employees from any
and all responsibility, liability, loss or damagesulting to any persons or property or
caused by or incidental to the demolition or movivayk.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 3 November 13, 2014




SECTION 118 - INSURANCE. Any person, firm or corporation, demolishing or
moving any building, structure or utility, shall mesit with the Building Official a
certificate of insurance showing the City of Ketohas a named insured on the insurance
policy. The certificate of insurance shall evidetitat the liability insurance policy covers
the policy holder and the City of Ketchum as a ndnmsured. Such insurance shall be
valid at all times during demolition or moving opgons. Said liability insurance
coverage shall be in the amount of at least $10000for bodily or personal injury, death,
or property damage or loss as the result of any(bneccurrence or accident, regardless of
the number of persons injured or the number ofr@aits. The purpose of the insurance
required herein is specified in Section 3601 of tDhapter.

SECTION 119 -DAMAGE TO PUBLIC PROPERTY. As a condition of obtaining
a permit to wreck, remove or move any buildinguasture or utility, the permittee
assumes liability for any damage to public propeoigcasioned by such moving,
demolition or removal operations.

()  Section 202 of said Code is amended by addingallefing definition:

COMMENCEMENT OF WORK - Any excavation including the removal of top soil or
any removal of trees or brush prepatory to excawatshall be defined as the
commencement of work authorized by a permit.

(h) Section 305.2.3 is amended to read as follows:

Twelve (12) or fewer children in a dwelling unit.

A facility such as the above within a dwelling umihd having twelve (12) or fewer
children receiving such day care shall be clasbiis a Group R-3 occupancy or shall
comply with the International Residential Code.

0] Section 308.6.4 is amended to read as follows:

Persons receiving care in a dwelling unit.

A facility such as the above within a dwelling umihd having twelve (12) or fewer
children receiving day care or having five (5) ewér persons receiving custodial care
shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy ofl slemply with the International
Residential Code.

() Section 310.5 is amended to read as follows:
Residential Group R-3.
Residential occupancies where the occupants aneaply permanent in nature and not
classified as Group R-1, R-2, R-4, E or |, inclgdin

I. Buildings that do not contain more than two d®2)elling units;

il. Boarding houses (nontransient) with sixtee®) (dr fewer occupants;

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 4 November 13, 2014




iii. Boarding houses (transient) with ten (10) ewer occupants;

iv. Care facilities that provide accommodationsfiee (5) or fewer persons receiving
care;

V. Congregate living facilities (nontransient) kvtixteen (16) or fewer occupants;

Vi. Congregate living facilities (transient) witin (10) or fewer occupants; or

Vil. Dwelling units providing day care for twel{&2) or fewer children.

(k) Section 310.5.1 is amended to read as follows:

Care facilities within a dwelling.

Care facilities for twelve (12) or fewer childreeceiving day care or for five (5) or fewer
persons receiving care that are within a singlefaawelling are permitted to comply
with the International Residential Code.

)] Sections 416.6 and 416.6.1 are added to read:

416.6 Finish application during construction.

Proper ventilation must be provided and an autamspirinkler system installed and
operational in the area where volatile finishes tarde applied prior to application of
combustible finishes unless an alternative pratecsystem is approved by the Fire
Chief.

416.6.1 Application of finishes in ocpied buildings.

Application of combustible or toxic finishes in aggace in an occupied building
shall require prior approval of the Building Offitiand the Fire Chief. Proper
ventilation must be provided to prevent vapors fieoumulating in the occupied
space,

(m)  Section 505.3.1 is added to read as follows:
505.3.1 Egress Group R.
Where a mezzanine is contained completely withdwelling unit it shall be provided
with at least one emergency escape and rescuengpemmplying with Section 1026.
(n) Section 506.3 is revised to read:
Section 506.3 Automatic sprinkler system increase.
Where a building is equipped throughout with anraped automatic sprinkler system in

accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, the area limitain Table 503 is permitted to be
increased by the following additional amounts:

1. Type | and Type Il construction: an additional 28€rcent (= 2) for buildings
with more than one story above grade plane andldiii@nal 300 percent {E£ 3)

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 5 November 13, 2014




for buildings with no more than one story abovedgrplane.

2. For Type lll, Type IV, and Type V construction: additional 100 percent<f1)
for buildings with more than one story above gratlne and an additional 200
percent (= 2) for buildings with no more than one story abgvade plane.

These increases are permitted in addition to thghb@nd story increases in accordance
with Section 504.2.

Exceptions: The building area limitation increases shall not be permitted for the
following conditions:

1. The automatic sprinkler system increase shall mmilyato buildings with
occupancy in Group H-1.

2. The automatic sprinkler system increase shall mpplyato the floor area of
occupancy in Use Group H-2 or H-3. For mixed usiédimgs containing such
occupancies, the allowable area shall be calculmteztcordance with Section
508.3.3.2, with the sprinkler increase applicabtdyoto the portions of the
building not classified as Use Group H-2 or H-3.

3. Fire-resistance rating substitution in accordanite Wable 601, Note d.

(0) Section 508.2.4 of said Code is amended byngdkception 4 as follows:

4. Boilers, central heating plants or mechanicabnis containing fuel fired
appliances shall be completely protected on thehar@cal side by a minimum of
5/8 inch Type X gypsum wallboard or equivalent #melwalls shall be effectively
draft stopped.

(p) Section 903 is deleted in its entirety and & Section 903 is adopted as follows:
SECTION 903 AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS

903 An approved fire sprinkler system shall be insthifieroughout all new buildings
with 6,000 or more square feet of floor area orcastained in the following chapter.
Partially fire sprinklered buildings are not allodven the City of Ketchum. For purposes
of this Chapter, Fire Walls shall not define sefmtauildings.

903.1 General.
Automatic sprinkler systems shall comply with théction.

903.1.1 Alternative protection.

Alternative automatic fire-extinguishing systemsngdying with Section 904 shall be
permitted in lieu of automatic sprinkler protectiamere recognized by the applicable
standard and approved by the fire code official.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 6 November 13, 2014




903.2 Where required.
Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new budgiand structures shall be provided in
the locations described in Sections 903.2.1 thr@ffh2.12.

Exception: Spaces or areas in telecommunications buildingsd useclusively for
telecommunications equipment, associated electrpalver distribution equipment,
batteries and standby engines, provided those spacareas are equipped throughout
with an automatic smoke detection system in acecarelavith Section 907.2 and are
separated from the remainder of the building by lests than 1-hour fire barriers
constructed in accordance with Section 707 of tiierhational Building Code or not less
than 2-hour horizontal assemblies constructed coraance with Section 711 of the
International Building Code, or both.

903.2.1 Group A.

An automatic sprinkler system shall be provideatighout buildings and portions thereof
used as Group A occupancies as provided in thisosed-or Group A-1, A-2, A-3 and A-
4 occupancies, the automatic sprinkler system &leafirovided throughout the floor area
where the Group A-1, A-2, A-3 or A-4 occupancy asdted, and in all floors from the
Group A occupancy to, and including, the nearegell®f exit discharge serving the
Group A occupancy. For Group A-5 occupancies, titeraatic sprinkler system shall be
provided in the spaces indicated in Section 90%2.1

903.2.1.1 Group A-1.

An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided@ooup A-1 occupancies where one of
the following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 6,000 square feet (557 m2)

2 The fire area has an occupant load of 300 oemor

3. The fire area is located on a floor other thdeval of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

4. The fire area contains a multitheater complex.

903.2.1.2 Group A-2.

An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided@ooup A-2 occupancies where one of
the following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet (464 m2)

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 100 oemor

3. The fire area is located on a floor other thaeval of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 7 November 13, 2014




903.2.1.3 Group A-3.
An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided@ooup A-3 occupancies where one of
the following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 6,000 square feet (557 m2)
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 oemor

3. The fire area is located on a floor other thdeval of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

903.2.1.4 Group A-4.
An automatic sprinkler system shall be providedGooup A-4 occupancies where one of
the following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 6,000 square feet (557 m2)
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 oemor

3. The fire area is located on a floor other thaeval of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

903.2.1.5 Group A-5.

An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided €@moup A-5 occupancies in the
following areas: concession stands, retail are@sspboxes and other accessory use areas
in excess of 1,000 square feet (93 m2).

903.2.2 Ambulatory care facilities.
An automatic sprinkler system shall be installedtighout the entire floor containing an
ambulatory care facility where either of the foliogy conditions exist at any time:

1. Four or more care recipients are incapable Ibfpseservation, whether rendered
incapable by staff or staff has accepted respditgilior care recipients already
incapable.

2. One or more care recipients that are incapabkelbépreservation are located at

other than the level of exit discharge serving suéhcility.

In buildings where ambulatory care is provided ewmels other than the level of exit
discharge, an automatic sprinkler system shallris¢alled throughout the entire floor
where such care is provided as well as all flo@lsw, and all floors between the level of
ambulatory care and the nearest level of exit @iggh including the level of exit
discharge.

903.2.3 Group E.
An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided@ooup E occupancies as follows:

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 8 November 13, 2014




1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater th@® square feet (557 m2) in area.

2. Throughout every portion of educational buildifzgelow the lowest level of exit
discharge serving that portion of the building.

Exception: An automatic sprinkler system is not required ity anea below the lowest
level of exit discharge serving that area whereneetassroom throughout the building
has at least one exterior exit door at ground level

903.2.4 Group F-1.
An automatic sprinkler system shall be providedtighout all buildings containing a
Group F-1 occupancy where one of the following ¢oowls exists:

1. A Group F-1 fire area exceeds 6,000 squarg5&at m2).
2. A Group F-1 fire area is located more than tisteees above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areasatinfloors, including any
mezzanines, exceeds 6,000 square feet (557 m2).

4. A Group F-1 occupancy used for the manufactdreipholstered furniture or
mattresses exceeds 2,500 square feet (232 m2).

903.2.4.1 Woodworking operations.

An automatic sprinkler system shall be provideaulghout all Group F-1 occupancy fire

areas that contain woodworking operations in exo€2s500 square feet in area (232 m2)
which generate finely divided combustible wastavbich use finely divided combustible

materials.

903.2.5 Group H.
Automatic sprinkler systems shall be provided ighhhazard occupancies as required in
Sections 903.2.5.1 through 903.2.5.3.

903.2.5.1 General.
An automatic sprinkler system shall be installemoup H occupancies.

903.2.5.2 Group H-5 occupancies.

An automatic sprinkler system shall be installesbtighout buildings containing Group
H-5 occupancies. The design of the sprinkler systbail not be less than that required
under the International Building Code for the ocmgy hazard classifications in
accordance with Table 903.2.5.2.

Where the design area of the sprinkler system stmef a corridor protected by one row
of sprinklers, the maximum number of sprinklersuiegd to be calculated is 13.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 9 November 13, 2014




TABLE 903.2.5.2
GROUP H-5 SPRINKLER DESIGN CRITERIA

LOCATION OCCUPANCY HAZARD
CLASSIFICATION

Fabrication areas Ordinary Hazard Group 2

Service corridors Ordinary Hazard Group 2

Storage rooms without dispensing Ordinary Hazamu@ 2

Storage rooms with dispensing Extra Hazard Group 2

Corridors Ordinary Hazard Group 2

903.2.5.3 Pyroxylin plastics.

An automatic sprinkler system shall be providediuildings, or portions thereof, where
cellulose nitrate film or pyroxylin plastics are mdactured, stored or handled in
guantities exceeding 100 pounds (45 kg).

903.2.6 Group |.
An automatic sprinkler system shall be provideatighout buildings with a Group | fire

area.
Exceptions:
1. An automatic sprinkler system installed in ademce with Section 903.3.1.2 shall

be permitted in Group I-1 facilities.

2. An automatic sprinkler system installed in ademce with Section 903.3.1.3 shall
be allowed in Group I-1 facilities when in compléanwith all of the following:

2.1. A hydraulic design information sign is locatedthe system riser;
2.2. Exception 1 of Section 903.4 is not applied] a

2.3. Systems shall be maintained in accordance with requirements of
Section 903.3.1.2.

3. An automatic sprinkler system is not requirecerehday care facilities are at the
level of exit discharge and where every room wleane is provided has at least
one exterior exit door.

4. In buildings where Group I-4 day care is prodid® levels other than the level of
exit discharge, an automatic sprinkler system goetance with Section 903.3.1.1
shall be installed on the entire floor where carerovided and all floors between
the level of care and the level of exit discha@éfloors below the level of exit
discharge, other than areas classified as an qgr&img garage.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 10 November 13, 2014




903.2.7 Group M.
An automatic sprinkler system shall be provideatighout buildings containing a Group
M occupancy where one of the following conditionssts:

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 6,000 square fégt (B2).
2. A Group M fire area is located more than thteeies above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas dinflaors, including any
mezzanines, exceeds 6,000 square feet (557 m2).

4. A Group M occupancy used for the display an@ sdlupholstered furniture or
mattresses exceeds 5,000 square feet (464 m2).

903.2.7.1 High-piled storage.
An automatic sprinkler system shall be providedeagiired in Chapter 32 in all buildings
of Group M where storage of merchandise is in lgded or rack storage arrays.

903.2.8 Group R.

An automatic sprinkler system installed in accomarwith Section 903.3 shall be

provided throughout all buildings with a Group Refiarea. Notwithstanding other
provisions of this section, all single family hontessignated R-3 by the International Fire
Code are hereby exempted from the fire sprinklguirement provided the minimum fire

flows specified in the 2012 International Fire Coigpendix B are met. Nothing in this

chapter shall prevent any person from voluntanigtalling an automatic fire sprinkler

system.

903.2.8.1 Group R-3 or R-4 congregate residences.
An automatic sprinkler system installed in accomamith Section 903.3.1.3 shall be
permitted in Group R-3 or R-4 congregate livinglfaes with 16 or fewer residents.

903.2.8.2 Care facilities.

An automatic sprinkler system installed in accomamith Section 903.3.1.3 shall be
permitted in care facilities with 5 or fewer indiuals in a single-family dwelling.

903.2.9 Group S-1.

An automatic sprinkler system shall be provideddghout all buildings containing a
Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following doms exists:

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 6,000 squarg3e&tm2).

2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than tisteges above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group S-1 fire areasatinfloors, including any
mezzanines, exceeds 6,000 square feet (557 m2).

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 11 November 13, 2014




4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage afroercial trucks or buses where the
fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet (464 m2).

5. A Group S-1 occupancy used for the storage bblgpered furniture or mattresses
exceeds 2,500 square feet (232 m2).

903.2.9.1 Repair garages.
An automatic sprinkler system shall be providedtighout all buildings used as repair
garages in accordance with Section 406.8 of trerriational Building Code, as shown:

1. Buildings having two or more stories above gratene, including basements,
with a fire area containing a repair garage excepdi000 square feet (557 m2).

2. Buildings no more than one story above gradeeylaith a fire area containing a
repair garage exceeding 6,000 square feet (557 m2).

3. Buildings with repair garages servicing vehigasked in basements.

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the repair of owrtial trucks or buses where the
fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet (464 m2).

903.2.9.2 Bulk storage of tires.

Buildings and structures where the area for theagm of tires exceeds 10,000 cubic feet
(276 m2) shall be equipped throughout with an aatarsprinkler system in accordance
with Section 903.3.1.1.

903.2.10 Group S-2 enclosed parking garages.

An automatic sprinkler system shall be providedotighout buildings classified as
enclosed parking garages in accordance with Seddén6 of the International Building
Code as follows:

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parkingggmexceeds 6,000 square feet (557
m2); or
2. Where the enclosed parking garage is locateddtkrother groups.

903.2.10.1 Commercial parking garages.
An automatic sprinkler system shall be providedtghout buildings used for storage of
commercial trucks or buses where the fire areaers8,000 square feet (464 m2).

903.2.11 Specific buildings areas and hazards.

In all occupancies other than Group U, an autonsgimkler system shall be installed for
building design or hazards in the locations sethfdn Sections 903.2.11.1 through
903.2.11.6.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 12 November 13, 2014




903.2.11.1 Stories without openings.

An automatic sprinkler system shall be installedotighout all stories, including
basements, of all buildings where the floor arezeess 1,500 square feet (139.4 m2) and
where there is not provided at least one of thiefohg types of exterior wall openings:

1. Openings below grade that lead directly to gdblevel by an exterior stairway
complying with Section 1009 or an outside ramp clying with Section 1010.
Openings shall be located in each 50 linear feet240 mm), or fraction thereof,
of exterior wall in the story on at least one sifibe required openings shall be
distributed such that the lineal distance betwegacant openings does not exceed
50 feet (15 240 mm).

2. Openings entirely above the adjoining grounetliéetaling at least 20 square feet
(1.86 m2) in each 50 linear feet (15 240 mm), actipn thereof, of exterior wall
in the story on at least one side. The requirechiogs shall be distributed such
that the lineal distance between adjacent operdngs not exceed 50 feet (15 240
mm). The height of the bottom of the clear opersh@ll not exceed 44 inches
(1118 mm) measured from the floor.

903.2.11.1.1 Opening dimensions and access.

Openings shall have a minimum dimension of not tess 30 inches (762 mm). Such
openings shall be accessible to the fire departrfremt the exterior and shall not be
obstructed in a manner that firefighting or resaamnot be accomplished from the
exterior.

903.2.11.1.2 Openings on one side only.

Where openings in a story are provided on only side and the opposite wall of such
story is more than 75 feet (22 860 mm) from sucenapgs, the story shall be equipped
throughout with an approved automatic sprinkletesysor openings as specified above
shall be provided on at least two sides of theystor

903.2.11.1.3 Basements.

Where any portion of a basement is located mone Tafeet (22 860 mm) from openings
required by Section 903.2.11.1, or where walls tifi@ns or other obstructions are
installed that restrict the application of watesnfr hose streams, the basement shall be
equipped throughout with an approved automaticgfer system.

903.2.11.2 Rubbish and linen chutes.

An automatic sprinkler system shall be installethattop of rubbish and linen chutes and
in their terminal rooms. Chutes shall have addélasprinkler heads installed at alternate
floors and at the lowest intake. Where a rubbishtelextends through a building more
than one floor below the lowest intake, the extemshall have sprinklers installed that
are recessed from the drop area of the chute amtéqgbed from freezing in accordance
with Section 903.3.1.1. Such sprinklers shall Istalhed at alternate floors beginning with
the second level below the last intake and endiith e floor above the discharge.
Chute sprinklers shall be accessible for servicing.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 13 November 13, 2014




903.2.11.3 Buildings 55 feet or more in height.

An automatic sprinkler system shall be installecbtighout buildings with a floor level
having an occupant load of 30 or more that is Ed&5 feet (16 764 mm) or more above
the lowest level of fire department vehicle access.

Exceptions:

1. Airport control towers.

2. Open parking structures.
3. Occupancies in Group F-2.

903.2.11.4 Ducts conveying hazardous exhausts.
Where required by the International Mechanical Coaetomatic sprinklers shall be
provided in ducts conveying hazardous exhaust,flabie or combustible materials.

Exception: Ducts where the largest cross-sectional diametehefduct is less than 10
inches (254 mm).

903.2.11.5 Commercial cooking operations.
An automatic sprinkler system shall be installecaitommercial kitchen exhaust hood
and duct system where an automatic sprinkler sysersed to comply with Section 904.

903.2.11.6 Other required suppression systems.

In addition to the requirements of Section 903l#& provisions indicated in Table
903.2.11.6 also require the installation of a fitppression system for certain buildings
and areas.

TABLE 903.2.11.6

ADDITIONAL REQUIRED FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS

SECTION SUBJECT

914.2.1 Covered and open mall buildings
914.3.1 High rise buildings

914.4.1 Atriums

9145.1 Underground structures
914.6.1 Stages

914.7.1 Special amusement buildings
914.8.2,914.8.5 Aircraft hangars

914.9 Flammable finishes

914.10 Drying rooms

914.11.1 Ambulatory care facilities

(continued)

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 14 November 13, 2014




TABLE 903.2.11.6—continued

ADDITIONAL REQUIRED FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS

SECTION SUBJECT

1028.6.2.3 Smoke-protected assembly seating

1103.4.1 Pyroxylin plastic storage in existing
buildings

1103.4.2 Existing Group I-2 occupancies

2108.2 Dry cleaning plants

2108.3 Dry cleaning machines

2309.3.2.6.2 Hydrogen motor fuel-dispensing area
canopies

2404.2 Spray finishing in Group A, E, l or R

2404.4 Spray booths and spray rooms

2405.2 Dip-tank rooms in Group A, | or R

2405.4.1 Dip tanks

2405.9.4 Hardening and tempering tanks

2703.10 HPM facilities

2703.10.1.1 HPM work station exhaust

2703.10.2 HPM gas cabinets and exhausted
enclosures

2703.10.3 HPM exit access corridor

2703.10.4 HPM exhaust ducts

2703.10.4.1 HPM noncombustible ducts

2703.10.4.2 HPM combustible ducts

2807.3 Lumber production conveypr
enclosures

2808.7 Recycling facility conveyar
enclosures

3006.1 Class A and B ovens

3006.2 Class C and D ovens

Table 3206.2 Storage fire protection

3206.4 Storage

5003.8.4.1 Gas rooms

5003.8.5.3 Exhausted enclosures

5004.5 Indoor storage of hazardous materjals

5005.1.8 Indoor dispensing of hazardous
materials

5104.4.1 Aerosol warehouses

5106.3.2 Aerosol display and merchandising
areas

5204.5 Storage of more than 1,000 cubic feet

of loose combustible fibers

(continued)

ORDINANCE NO. ??2??

15 November 13, 2014




TABLE 903.2.11.6—continued

ADDITIONAL REQUIRED FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS

SECTION SUBJECT

5306.2.1 Exterior medical gas storage room

5306.2.2 Interior medical gas storage room

5306.2.3 Medical gas storage cabinet

5606.5.2.1 Storage of smokeless propellant

5606.5.2.3 Storage of small arms primers

5704.3.7.5.1 Flammable and combustible liquid
storage rooms

5704.3.8.4 Flammable and combustible liquid
storage warehouses

5705.3.7.3 Flammable and combustible liquid
Group H-2 or H-3 areas

6004.1.2 Gas cabinets for highly toxic gnd
toxic gas

6004.1.3 Exhausted enclosures for highly toxic
and toxic gas

6004.2.2.6 Gas rooms for highly toxic and toxic
gas

6004.3.3 Outdoor storage for highly toxic gnd
toxic gas

6504.1.1 Pyroxylin plastic storage cabinets

6504.1.3 Pyroxylin plastic storage vaults

6504.2 Pyroxylin  plastic storage apd
manufacturing

For SlI: 1 cubic foot = 0.023 m3.

903.2.12 During construction.
Automatic sprinkler systems required during corgtam, alteration and demolition
operations shall be provided in accordance withi@e&313.

903.3 Installation requirements.
Automatic sprinkler systems shall be designed asthiled in accordance with Sections
903.3.1 through 903.3.7.

903.3.1 Standards.
Sprinkler systems shall be designed and instaledctordance with Section 903.3.1.1,
903.3.1.2 or 903.3.1.3 and other chapters of thie cas applicable.

903.3.1.1 NFPA 13 sprinkler systems.

Where the provisions of this code require that gdimg or portion thereof be equipped
throughout with an automatic sprinkler system incdance with this section, sprinklers
shall be installed throughout in accordance witiPRFL3 except as provided in Section

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 16 November 13, 2014




903.3.1.1.1.

903.3.1.1.1 Exempt locations.

Automatic sprinklers shall not be required in tlbldwing rooms or areas where such
rooms or areas are protected with an approved aitionfire detection system in
accordance with Section 907.2 that will respondvisible or invisible particles of
combustion. Sprinklers shall not be omitted frony amom merely because it is damp, of
fire-resistance rated construction or containsteted equipment.

1. Any room where the application of water, or fleaand water, constitutes a serious
life or fire hazard.

2. Any room or space where sprinklers are consitleredesirable because of the
nature of the contents, when approved by the édeofficial.

3. Generator and transformer rooms separated fn@meimainder of the building by
walls and floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling assembliegving a fire-resistance rating of
not less than 2 hours.

4. Rooms or areas that are of noncombustible asctgin with wholly
noncombustible contents.

5. Fire service access elevator machine rooms authimery spaces.

6. Machine rooms and machinery spaces associatéll eodcupant evacuation
elevators designed in accordance with Section 39G8e International Building
Code.

903.3.1.2 NFPA 13R sprinkler systems.
Automatic sprinkler systems in Group R occupanadiggo and including four stories in
height shall be permitted to be installed througho@ccordance with NFPA 13R.

903.3.1.2.1 Balconies and decks.

Sprinkler protection shall be provided for exterimaticonies, decks and ground floor
patios of dwelling units where the building is ofpE V construction, provided there is a
roof or deck above. Sidewall sprinklers that areduso protect such areas shall be
permitted to be located such that their deflecayes within 1 inch (25 mm) to 6 inches
(152 mm) below the structural members and a maxirdistance of 14 inches (356 mm)
below the deck of the exterior balconies and déicasare constructed of open wood joist
construction.

903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D sprinkler systems.

Automatic sprinkler systems installed in one and-family dwellings, Group R-3 and R-
4 congregate living facilities and townhouses shalpermitted to be installed throughout
in accordance with NFPA 13D.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 17 November 13, 2014




903.3.2 Quick-response and residential sprinklers.

Where automatic sprinkler systems are requiredhisydode, quick-response or residential
automatic sprinklers shall be installed in thedwling areas in accordance with Section
903.3.1 and their listings:

1. Throughout all spaces within a smoke compartnmeamitaining care recipient
sleeping units in Group I-2 in accordance withltiternational Building Code.

2. Throughout all spaces within a smoke compartroentaining treatment rooms in
ambulatory care facilities.

3. Dwelling units and sleeping units in Group Ifid&R occupancies.
4. Light-hazard occupancies as defined in NFPA 13.

903.3.3 Obstructed locations.

Automatic sprinklers shall be installed with dugasd to obstructions that will delay
activation or obstruct the water distribution patteéAutomatic sprinklers shall be installed
in or under covered kiosks, displays, booths, cesioa stands or equipment that exceeds
4 feet (1219 mm) in width. Not less than a 3-f@#4 mm) clearance shall be maintained
between automatic sprinklers and the top of pifesombustible fibers.

Exception: Kitchen equipment under exhaust hoods protecteld aifire-extinguishing
system in accordance with Section 904.

903.3.4 Actuation.
Automatic sprinkler systems shall be automaticattjuated unless specifically provided
for in this code.

903.3.5 Water supplies.

Water supplies for automatic sprinkler systems Ist@aiply with this section and the
standards referenced in Section 903.3.1. The potalsiter supply shall be protected
against backflow in accordance with the requirementhis section and the International
Plumbing Code.

903.3.5.1 Domestic services.
Where the domestic service provides the water gupplthe automatic sprinkler system,
the supply shall be in accordance with this section

903.3.5.1.1 Limited area sprinkler systems.

Limited area sprinkler systems serving fewer th@rsgrinklers on any single connection
are permitted to be connected to the domestic@where a wet automatic standpipe is
not available. Limited area sprinkler systems catet to domestic water supplies shall
comply with each of the following requirements:

1. Valves shall not be installed between the doimesater riser control valve and

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 18 November 13, 2014




the sprinklers.

Exception: An approved indicating control valve supervisedha open position
in accordance with Section 903.4.

2. The domestic service shall be capable of supglyhe simultaneous domestic
demand and the sprinkler demand required to bealidally calculated by NFPA
13, NFPA 13D or NFPA 13R.

903.3.5.1.2 Residential combination services.
A single combination water supply shall be allovpedvided that the domestic demand is
added to the sprinkler demand as required by NFBR 1

903.3.5.2 Secondary water supply.

An automatic secondary on-site water supply havengapacity not less than the

hydraulically calculated sprinkler demand, inclglthe hose stream requirement, shall be
provided for high-rise buildings in Seismic Desigategory C, D, E or F as determined

by the International Building Code. An additionaiefpump shall not be required for the

secondary water supply unless needed to providenthenum design intake pressure at

the suction side of the fire pump supplying theoadtic sprinkler system. The secondary
water supply shall have a duration of not less tBGnminutes as determined by the

occupancy hazard classification in accordance WERA 13

Exception: Existing buildings.
903.3.6 Hose threads.
Fire hose threads and fittings used in connectibim automatic sprinkler systems shall be

as prescribed by the fire code official.

903.3.7 Fire department connections.
The location of fire department connections shalbpproved by the fire code official.

903.4 Sprinkler system supervision and alarms.

All valves controlling the water supply for automsasprinkler systems, pumps, tanks,
water levels and temperatures, critical air pressuand water-flow switches on all
sprinkler systems shall be electrically supervigga listed fire alarm control unit.
Exceptions:

1. Control valves to commercial kitchen hoods, papray booths or dip tanks that
are sealed or locked in the open position.

2. Valves controlling the fuel supply to fire purapgines that are sealed or locked in
the open position.

3. Trim valves to pressure switches in dry, presctnd deluge sprinkler systems

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 19 November 13, 2014




that are sealed or locked in the open position.

903.4.1 Monitoring.

Alarm, supervisory and trouble signals shall betimitly different and shall be
automatically transmitted to an approved supergistation or, when approved by the fire
code official, shall sound an audible signal abastantly attended location.

Exceptions:

1. Underground key or hub valves in roadway boxesided by the municipality or
public utility are not required to be monitored.

2. Backflow prevention device test valves locatedimited area sprinkler system
supply piping shall be locked in the open positisnoccupancies required to be
equipped with a fire alarm system, the backflowvprger valves shall be
electrically supervised by a tamper switch insthile accordance with NFPA 72
and separately annunciated.

903.4.2 Alarms.

An approved audible device, located on the exteoibthe building in an approved

location, shall be connected to each automaticklen system. Such sprinkler water-flow
alarm devices shall be activated by water flow egjent to the flow of a single sprinkler

of the smallest orifice size installed in the syst&Vhere a fire alarm system is installed,
actuation of the automatic sprinkler system shaliate the building fire alarm system.

903.4.3 Floor control valves.
Approved supervised indicating control valves shellprovided at the point of connection
to the riser on each floor in high-rise buildings.

903.5 Testing and maintenance.
Sprinkler systems shall be tested and maintainedéordance with Section 901.

903.6Where required in existing buildings and structures
An automatic sprinkler system shall be provideexisting buildings and structures where
required in Chapter 11.

903.7 Construction documentsOne (1) electronic copy and two (2) paper copies of
construction documents, including hydraulic caltioless and device specifications, along
with a Ketchum Fire Department Fire Sprinkler PRaview form for all fire sprinkler
systems shall be submitted for review and apprevaldr to system installation. Fire
Department review and approval shall normally beagleted within fifteen (15) calendar
days. Exceptions to the fifteen (15) calendar deyjew may be made where in the
opinion of the Fire Chief, the plans submitted sre complex and additional time for
review is required. Construction shall not commemat! approval and a permit from the
Fire Department is obtained.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 20 November 13, 2014




() That said International Building Code is herelmgended by deleting Section 907.1.1 in
its entirety and adopting a new Section 907.1.tth&r amended by adopting a new
Section 907.2.24, a new Section 907.10 and adoptmew Section 907.11 as follows:

907.1.1 Construction documentsA Ketchum Fire Department Fire Alarm Installation
Permit Application, one (1) electronic copy and t{&) paper copies of construction
documents and fire alarm shop drawings for firamalaystems shall be submitted for
review and approval prior to system installatioire FDepartment review and approval
shall normally be completed within fifteen (15) eadlar days. Exceptions to the fifteen
(15) calendar day review may be made where in pir@ian of the Fire Code Official, the
plans submitted are too complex and additional fionaeview is required. Construction
shall not commence until approval and a permit fritve Fire Department is obtained.
Construction documents for fire alarm systems dbalbf sufficient clarity to indicate the
location, nature and extent of the work proposetisirow in detail that it will conform to
the provisions of this code, the International Bung Code, and relevant laws, ordinances,
rules and regulations, as determined by the ficdeaficial.

907.2.24 City of Ketchum Required Installations

Notwithstanding the previous installation requirerise an approved monitored automatic
fire alarm system shall be installed in the follogiiocations;

€)) In Zoning Districts CC, LI-1, LI-2, LI-3, T, -BO00, and T-4000 every new
building constructed for nonresidential occupanayluding buildings with
sleeping quarters as a secondary use.

(b) In Zoning Districts CC, GR-H, STO-H, T-3000ckaii-4000 every new building
constructed for any residential use, and over 48fifare feet in floor area, and
every newly constructed hotel, motel, apartmensbkaur lodge of any size.

(c) In Zoning districts CC, GR-H, STO-H, LI-1, &-LI-3, T, T-3000 and T-4000
every existing dwelling or commercial unit withinbailding that is altered or
changed, when such modifications exceed FifteeruSdad Dollars ($15,000.00)
in value. (Cosmetic modifications such as paintihgcorative window and floor
coverings and furniture shall not be consideredcastributing to the Fifteen
Thousand Dollar ($15,000.00) value limit). Saidsteyns must provide fire
detection for the entire building, including thastxg and new construction area,
when the alteration or change affects more thap (80) percent of the units in
that building.

Exception: A separate fire alarm system need not be instatidolildings which are
protected throughout by an approved supervised dpenkler system conforming to
NFPA standards 13, 13D or 13R and having a loeahato notify all occupants.

Note: Group E, Group I, Group R-1 and Group Re2upancies are excluded from this
exception.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 21 November 13, 2014




907.10 Definitions.

Alarm Signal is an audible or visual signal, or both, indicatitige existence of an
emergency fire condition. Audible devices may bdisbéhorns, chimes, speakers or
similar devices. Voice alarms and their messagedl dle approved by the Fire Code
Official.

Alarm System is a combination of approved compatible deviceshwiie necessary
electrical interconnection and energy to producealanm signal in the event of fire or
system activation.

Annunciator is equipment which indicates the zone or area lodiilling from which an
alarm has been initiated, the location of an alammating device or the operational
condition of the circuits of the system.

Compatible means tested by a nationally recognized testing@gt function properly
with the control unit monitoring system

Control Unit is a unit comprising the controls, relays, switclhesl associated circuits

necessary to (1) distribute power to a fire alagstean, (2) receive signals from alarm
initiating devices and transmit them to alarm slgmmadevices and accessory equipment
and, (3) electrically supervise the system cirguitr

False Alarms- An alarm signal necessitating response by theh{gh Fire Department
where an emergency does not exist. False alaratisb&hclassified as follows:

1. Nuisance Alarms- Alarms caused by factors which the alarm systemmat
intended to be activated by. This category shatluide, but is not limited to,
alarms caused by cooking smoke, inadequate hoysiegeeconstruction dusts,
and related building operations causing alarms

2. Intentional Alarms - Alarm system activation or alarm signal transimisdy any
person knowingly, willingly, or recklessly when remergency exists. This
category shall include, but is not limited to, #ivation of manual fire alarm pull
stations; discharge of fire-extinguishing equipmentppliances; or activation of
an alarm system in violation of orders issued un8ection 109.3 of this
ordinance.

3. Equipment Malfunction - An alarm caused by the failure of an alarm system
failure of peripheral equipment, causing or allogvan alarm signal transmission.

4. Undetermined Cause An alarm system activation or transmission ofaésrm
signal for which the cause cannot or has not beseriohined by responding
personnel and for which there is no apparent cansealarms due to failure to
maintain alarm systems in violation of orders issumder provisions of this
ordinance.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 22 November 13, 2014




5. Good Intent- This category shall include, but is not limited alarms transmitted
by an individual believing an emergency conditiomsts. Such alarms under this
category shall not be held to constitute a violatd this ordinance

Initiating Device is any manually or automatically operated equipmehtch, when
activated, initiates an alarm through an alarmaligg device.

Inspection Contract- An agreement in writing with an alarm company#sform testing
and inspection of a required fire alarm systemédarertain contractual period of time.
Such contract may include repair, installation andfelocation of equipment, as
necessary.

Maintenance Contract - An agreement in writing with an alarm companypeerform
repair, service and maintenance. Maintenance actistmay be required at the discretion
of the Fire Code Official for alarm systems showrbé subject to repeated false alarms.
Such contract may include inspection, testingaiteion and/or relocation of equipment,
as necessary.

Required Fire Alarm - A monitored fire or smoke detection system reggliby this
ordinance.

Signaling Deviceis equipment that produces an approved alarm signal

Smoke Detectoris an approved device which senses visible or iioleisparticles of
combustion. The detector shall bear a label oeroittentification issued by an approved
testing agency having a service for inspection afemals and workmanship at the factory
during fabrication and assembly.

Voice Over IP (VOIP) is a methodology and group of technologies fordbbvery of
voice communications and multimedia sessions aviermet Protocol (IP) networks, such
as the Internet. VOIP networks are not approvedaukt for transmitting alarm signals to
a monitoring station.

Zone is a building or defined area of a building as appd by the Fire Code Official for
purposes of identifying locations.

907.11 Performance Standards

1. All required supervised alarm systems shall aforded a thirty (30) day
adjustment period commencing with the date of atitim or issuance of a
Certificate of Occupancy in order that the systemyrbe brought to maximum
efficiency. During that period of time, no penatiigall be assessed against the
owner of the alarm system for system malfunctiomstentionally caused false
alarms, unauthorized service and tampering aresmioject to the thirty (30) day
grace period.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 23 November 13, 2014




2. Alarm systems shall be allowed no more than:
2.1. Three (3) false alarms in a thirty (30) dayiqd.
2.2. Six (6) false alarms in a one hundred eigh8@) day period.
2.3.  Nine (9) false alarms in a three hundred/gi@60) day period.

The owner of any alarm system found to have afalarm rate in excess of the
foregoing number of allowable alarms per specifiede period, shall receive

written notice of violation and the Fire Code Oilicmay require compliance with

Section 201 of the International Fire Code, FIRE TZA.

3. After the adjustment period, the owner of aarral system transmitting a false
alarm, upon the issuance of a written order byrésponding officer or his agent,
shall be required to do one and/or more of thewalhg:

3.1. Show a material change in employee trainifguch training may be
conducted by a representative of the owner or by @onjunction with a
representative of an alarm company.

3.2.  Show written proof that the alarm system lbeen inspected and tested by
an alarm company and detected faults have beeiedpa

3.3.  Show written proof that peripheral equipmémats been relocated in
accordance with applicable design standards anticaple codes by an
alarm company. It is understood, however, that enoof the
aforementioned requirements shall pertain to aasdn where a person
reported or transmitted an alarm with good intentsat forth in Section
907.2 of this ordinance, the definition of falsarats.

4. Any alarm system owner having complied witdess issued as required by this
section, and whose alarm system is still subjecefeated false alarms may be
required to participate in a discussion with a espntative from the Fire
Department, the owner of the alarm system or henagand the alarm company
responsible for the installation and/or service/anthe maintenance of the alarm
system, for the purpose of determining the cause{sAnd solutions(s) to the
problem(s). Orders may be issued to their alarstesy owner to facilitate the
resolution of the false alarm problem under thedoing section of this ordinance.

) Section 1505.2.1 is added to read:

1505.2.1 Class A Roof Assemblies Required.

Class A roof assemblies with no wood products m rihof covering are required on all
new buildings. Class A roof assemblies with no wgwdducts in roof covering are
required for all re-roofs over 3,000 square feetooff area. Class A is not required when
less than twenty-five (25) percent of the roof aseheing. repaired and additional areas

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 24 November 13, 2014




are not subsequently repaired within five (5) yeddditions to buildings over 1,000
square feet of roof area require that the roohefentire building be upgraded to a Class
A roof assembly with no wood products in the roo¥ering.

(s) Section 1605 of said code is amended to reéollaws:

In 1605.2 Load combinations using strength desigor load and resistance factor
design.Coefficient £ is amended to read as follows:

f, = 0.7 for roof configurations (such as saw tootiat do not shed snow off the structure,
and 0.35 for other roof configurations.

In 1605.3.2 Exception 2 is amended to read:

2. Flat roof snow loads of 30 psf (1.44 kNjror less and roof live loads of 30 psf
or less need not be combined with seismic loadserd/flat roof snow loads
exceed 30 psf (1.44 kNAp 35 percent of the flat roof snow load shall be
combined with seismic loads.

) Section 1608 of said Code is amended by chgngection 1608.2 to read as follows:

1608.2 Ground snow loads.
The ground snow loads to be used in determininglésegn snow loads for roofs, dor
Ketchum is determined to be site specific (CS) stmall be taken as 120 psf.

(u) Section 1608.4 is added:

1608.4 Flat roof snow loads.
The snow loadp in Ib/ft% on a roof with a slope equal to or less than Hllsbe the
greater of 100 psf or the value calculated usiegdfowing formula:

pr =0.7 CGCilp

(v) Section 1612 FLOOD LOADSshall have to following sections modified to reasl
follows:

1612.4 Design and construction.

The design and construction of building and stmeguocated irflood hazard areas,
including flood hazard areas subject to high-vélosiave action, shall be in accordance
with Chapter 5 of ASCE7, ASCE 24 and Ketchum MuywatiCode Chapter 17.88,
Floodplain Management Overlay Zoning District.

1612.5 Flood hazard documentation.
The following documentation shall be prepared agalesl by a licensed surveyor or civil
engineer and submitted to theilding official:

1. For construction iflood hazard areas not subject to high-velocity wave action:

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 25 November 13, 2014




1.1 The elevation of the lowest floor, includibgsement, as required by the
lowest floor elevation inspection in Section 118.3.

1.2.  For fully enclosed areas below the desigodielevation where provisions
to allow for the automatic entry and exit of flooalers do not meet the
minimum requirements in Section 2.6..2.1 of ASCE 2dnstruction
documents shall include a statement that eh desidjnprovide for
equalization of hydrostatic flood forces in accorckwith Section 2.6.2.2
of ASCE 24 and Ketchum Municipal Code Chapter 17 B®odplain
Management Overlay Zoning District.

1.3. For dry floodproofed nonresidential buildngconstruction documents
shall include a statement that the dry floodprapfils designed in
accordance with ASCE 24 and Ketchum Municipal CGthapter 17.88,
Floodplain Management Overlay Zoning District.

(w)  Section 1613.5 is added to read:
1613.5 Effective seismic weight.
The effective seismic weight in Section 12.7.2 &edtion 12.14.8.1 of ASCE7-10 shall

be amended as follows:

4. For all roofs regardless of roof slope 35%ha tniform design snow load shall
be included in the effective seismic weight (W).

(x) Delete footnote (f) contained under Table 2202inimum Number of Required
Plumbing Fixtures, and replace with the following:

()] Drinking fountains are not required for an opant load of thirty (30) or fewer.

(y) Delete footnote (g) contained under Table 290Rlinimum Number of Required
Plumbing Fixtures and replace with the following:

(9) For business occupancies, excluding restagyrantd mercantile occupancies with
an occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer, serviges shall not be required.

(2) Amend Section 1804.4 to read as follows:
1804.4 Grading and fill in flood hazard areas.
In flood hazard areas established in Section 1612.3, grading and/or diilkall not be
approved until a floodplain development permit, tmgpthe requirements of Ketchum
Municipal Code, Section 17.88 Floodplain Managem@nterlay Zoning District, has
been obtained.

(@a) Amend Section 1805.1.2.1 to read as follows:

1805.1.2.1 Flood hazard areas.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 26 November 13, 2014




For building and structures in flood hazard aremsestablished in Section 1612.3, the
finished ground level of an under-floor space sasha crawl space shall be equal to or
higher than the outside finished ground level oleast one side.

Exceptions:

1. Under-floor spaces of Group R-3 building that mbet requirements of Ketchum
Municipal Code, Section 17.88 Floodplain Manageni@werlay Zoning District.

2. Flood-proofed under-floor spaces that meet the ireqents of Ketchum
Municipal Code, Section 17.88 Floodplain Managen@werlay Zoning District.

(bb)  Amend Section B101.2.2 to read as follows:

Section B101.2.2 QualificationsThe board of appeals shall consist of five indiwidu
plus alternates, from the following professionslisciplines:

1. Registered design professional with architettexperience.
2. Registered design professional with structural meefiing experience.
3. Registered design professional with mechanical g@hambing engineering

experience or a mechanical contractor with at leastyears experience, five of
which shall have been in responsible charge of work

4. Registered design professional with architecturgbegience or a builder or
superintendent of building with at least ten yeaxgerience, five of which shall
have been in responsible charge of work.

5. Registered design professional with fire protecwmgineering experience or fire
protection contractor with ten years' experiencss 6f which shall have been in
responsible charge of work.

(cc)  Section J103.2 Exemption number 8 is addedad as follows:

8. Grading, excavation, earthwork, fills or emkments less than fifty (50) cubic
yards, and that do not create an increased elevidrobuildings or building sites
above natural existing grade and do not adverdidgtaadjoining properties.

(dd) Appendix G - FLOOD-RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION $iHaave to following sections
modified to read as follows:

Section G102.1 General.

This appendix, in conjunction with thinternational Building Code and Ketchum
Municipal Code, Chapter 17,88, Floodplain Managem@verlay Zoning District,
provides minimum requirements for development ledan flood hazard areas, including
the subdivision of land; installation of utilitiesplacement and replacement of

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 27 November 13, 2014




manufactured homes; new construction and repaconsgruction, rehabilitation or
additions to new construction; substantial improgam of existing buildings and
structures, including restoration after damage,pt@ary structures, and temporary or
permanent storage, utility ad miscellaneous Groupulldings and structures, and certain
building work exempt from permit under Section 205.

Section 102.2 Establishment of flood hazard areasdnsert [June 5, 1978]

Section G103.1 Permit applications.

No building permit for development on a lot thahtains regulatory floodplain shall be
accepted or issued without prior approval of a &fmain Development Permit per the
terms of Ketchum Municipal Code, Chapter 17,88,0Bmain Management Overlay
Zoning District. Thebuilding official shall review all permit applications to determine
whether proposed development sites will be readgrsatfe from flooding. If a proposed
development site is in a flood hazard area, a#t siévelopment activities (including
grading, filling, utility installation and drainagaodification), all new construction and
substantial improvement (including placement of fadcated buildings and
manufactured homes) and certain guiding work exeimppermit under Section 105.2
shall be design and constructed with methods, ipeceind material that minimize flood
damage and that are in accordance with this cod®CE#24 and Ketchum Municipal
Code, Chapter 17,88, Floodplain Management Oveftayng District.

Section G104.1 Required.

Any person, owner or authorized agent who intemdsdnduct any development in a
flood hazard area shall first make applicationh® Planning and Building Department per
the provisions of Ketchum Municipal Code, Chaptét,88, Floodplain Management
Overlay Zoning District.

Section G104.2 Application for permit.

Prior to submittal of an application for a buildipgrmit, any person, owner or authorized
agent who intends to conduct any development ifo@dfhazard area shall first make
application to the Planning and Building Departmeet the provisions of Ketchum
Municipal Code, Chapter 17,88, Floodplain Managen@verlay Zoning District. Upon
approval of a Floodplain Development Permit, theligant shall file a building permit
application in writing on a form furnished by theilding official. Such application shall:

1. Identify and describe the development to beeped by the permit.

2. Describe the land on which the proposed dewedoy is to be conducted by legal
description, street address or similar descriptioat will readily identify and
definitely locate the site.

3. Include a site plan showing the delineationflobd hazard areas, floodway
boundaries, flood zones, design flood elevationsugd elevations, proposed fill
and excavation and drainage patterns and facilities

4. Indicate the use and occupancy for which tiopgsed development is intended.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 28 November 13, 2014




5. Be accompanied by construction documents, ggadnd filling plans and other
information deemed appropriate by thelding official.

6. State the valuation of the proposed work.

7. Be signed by the applicant or the applicanitharized agent.
SECTION G105 VARIANCES

Section G105.1 General.

The Planning and Zoning Commission shall, per trevipions of Ketchum Municipal
Code, Chapter 17,88, Floodplain Management Ovettaying District, hear and decide
requests for variances.

Sections G105.2 — 10538hall be deleted.
SECTION G301 SUBDIVISIONS

Section G301.1 General.

Any subdivision proposal, including proposals foramafactured home parks and
subdivisions, or other proposed new developmeatfiood hazard area shall be reviewed
by pursuant to the provisions of Ketchum Municig@dde, Chapter 17,88, Floodplain
Management Overlay Zoning District.

SECTION G401 SITE IMPROVEMENT

Section G401.1 Development in floodways.

Development or land disturbing activity shall net &uthorized in th8oodway unless it
has been demonstrated through hydrologic and hidranalyses performed in
accordance with standard engineering practice tti@fproposed encroachment will not
result in any increase in the level of the bdleed per the provisions of Ketchum
Municipal Code, Chapter 17,88, Floodplain Managen@rerlay Zoning District.

G401.3 Sewer facilities.

All new or replaced sanitary sewer facilities, ptiy sewage treatment plants (including
all pumping stations and collector systems) anditswaste disposal systems shall be
designed in accordance with Chapter 7, ASCE 24 ted provisions of Ketchum
Municipal Code, Chapter 17,88, Floodplain Managam@wuerlay Zoning District, to
minimize or eliminate infiltration of floodwaterato the facilities and discharge from the
facilities into floodwaters, or impairment of thacflities and systems.

G401.4 Water facilities.

All new or replacement water facilities shall besideed in accordance with the
provisions of Chapter 7, ASCE 24 and the provisiofisKketchum Municipal Code,
Chapter 17,88, Floodplain Management Overlay Zomigjrict, to minimize or eliminate
infiltration of floodwaters into the systems.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 29 November 13, 2014




SECTION G501 MANUFACTURED HOMES

G501.1 Elevation.

All new and replacement manufactured homes to &eepl or substantially improved in a
flood hazard area shall be elevated such that the lowest floor ofttamufactured home is
elevated to a minimum of two feet above the deigpd elevation.

SECTION G801 OTHER BUILDING WORK

G801.1 Detached accessory structures.

Detached accessory structures shall be anchorpdetent flotation, collapse or lateral
movement resulting from hydrostatic loads, inclgdime effects of buoyancy, during
conditions of the desigiflood. Fully enclosed accessory structures shall hawedfl
openings to allow for the automatic entry and @fitflood waters and shall meet the
provisions of Ketchum Municipal Code, Chapter 17 B®odplain Management Overlay
Zoning District.

G801.2 Fences.

Fences in floodways that may block the passagéootiWaters, such as stockade fences
and wire mesh fences, shall meet the requireme8eofion G103.5 and the provisions of
Ketchum Municipal Code, Chapter 17,88, Floodplairandgement Overlay Zoning
District.

SECTION G1001 UTILITY AND MISCELLANEOUS GROUP U

G1001.1 Utility and miscellaneous Group U.

Utility and miscellaneous Group U includes buildirthat are accessory in character and
miscellaneous structures not classified in anyifipemccupancy in thénternational

Building Code, including, but not limited to, agricultural buitdjs, aircraft hangars
(accessory to a one- or two-family residence), ®ararports, fences more than 6 feet
(1829 mm) high, grain silos (accessory to a resideoccupancy), greenhouses, livestock
shelters, private garages, retaining walls, sh&dbles and towers.

G1001.2 Flood loads.

Utility and miscellaneous Group U buildings andistures, including substantial
improvement of such buildings and structures, dtethnchored to prevent flotation,
collapse or lateral movement resulting from floodds, including the effects of
buoyancy, during conditions of the desitpod.

G1001.3 Elevation.

Utility and miscellaneous Group U buildings andistures, including substantial
improvement of such buildings and structures, dimklevated such that the lowest floor,
including basement, is elevated to or above thggddéi®od elevation in accordance with
Section 1612 of thinternational Building Code and the provisions of Ketchum Municipal
Code, Chapter 17,88, Floodplain Management Ovettayng District.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 30 November 13, 2014




G1001.4 Enclosures below design flood elevation.

Fully enclosed areas below the design flood elemaghall meet the provisions of
Ketchum Municipal Code, Chapter 17,88, Floodplaianggement Overlay Zoning
District and conform to the following:

1. Inflood hazard areas not subject to high-velocity wave action, enclosed
areas shall have flood openings to allow for th@atic inflow and
outflow of floodwaters.

2. Inflood hazard areas subject to high-velocity wave action, enclosed sirea
shall have walls below the design flood elevatiuat are designed to break
away or collapse from a water load less than thatwould occur during
the design flood, without causing collapse, disptaent or other structural
damage to the building or structure.

G1001.5 Flood-damage-resistant materials.
Flood-damage-resistant materials shall be usedvdsle desigrilood elevation.

G1001.6 Protection of mechanical, plumbing and el&étcal systems.
Mechanical, plumbing and electrical systems, iniciggplumbing fixtures, shall be
elevated to or above the desitpod elevation.

Exception: Electrical systems, equipment and components, aedtirty,
ventilating, air conditioning, and plumbing appkas, plumbing fixtures, duct
systems and other service equipment shall be gednid be located below the
designflood elevation provided that they are designed and llegtdo prevent
water from entering or accumulating within the caments and to resist
hydrostatic and hydrodynamic loads and stressedudimg the effects of
buoyancy, during the occurrence of flooding to thesign flood elevation in
compliance with the flood-resistant constructiomuieements of this code.
Electrical wiring systems shall be permitted tolbeated below the design flood
elevation provided they conform to the provisioh®BPA 70.

(ee) Appendix L is added as follows:

APPENDIX L
RADON CONTROL METHODS

SECTION AL101 SCOPE

AL101.1 General.

This appendix contains requirements for new coonstm for all residential and
institutional occupancies (R1, R2, R3, R4, I, IR, and 14). Inclusion of this appendix is
based on the use of locally available data andterméation of Zone 1 designation in
Figure AL101 for all of Ketchum.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 31 November 13, 2014




Exception: In mixed use buildings containing residential ostitutional occupancies
Radon mitigation measures are not required if thenes can demonstrate that the
proposed design is not likely to produce unaccdetivels of Radon in sleeping areas.
The owner, or the owner's authorized representasivall have an approved Radon test
conducted in a representative sleeping area olotest residential level and shall submit
the test results to the building department poa Certificate of Occupancy being issued
for the project.

SECTION AL102 DEFINITIONS

AL102.1 General.
For the purpose of these requirements, the terexs sizall be defined as follows:

SUBSLAB DEPRESSURIZATION SYSTEM (Passive) A system designed to achieve
lower sub-slab air pressure relative to indoorpagssure by use of a vent pipe routed
through theconditioned space of a building and connecting the sub-slab area witidaor
air, thereby relying on the convective flow of apward in the vent to draw air from
beneath the slab.

SUBSLAB DEPRESSURIZATION SYSTEM (Active). A system designed to achieve
lower sub-slab air pressure relative to indoorpagssure by use of a fan-powered vent
drawing air from beneath the slab.

DRAIN TILE LOOP. A continuous length of drain tile or perforated gipxtending
around all or part othe internal or external perimeter ofbasement or crawl space
footing.

RADON GAS. A naturally-occurring, chemically inert, radiomet gas that is not
detectable by human senses. As a gas it can maddyréhroughparticles of soil and
rock and can accumulate under the slabs and foondabf homes where it can easily
enter into the living space through constructicacks and openings.

SOIL-GAS-RETARDER. A continuous membrane of 6-mil (0.15 mm) polyetingeor
other equivalent material used to retard the fldwadl gases into a building.

SUBMEMBRANE DEPRESSURIZATION SYSTEM. A system designed to achieve
lower sub-membrane air pressure relative to crgace air pressure by use of a vent
drawing air from beneath the soil-gas-retarder nramd

SECTION AL103 REQUIREMENTS

AL103.1 General.

The following construction techniques are intentledesist radon entry and prepare the
building for post-construction radon mitigationrniécessary (see Figure AF102). These
techniques are required in areas where designgtdeeurisdiction.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 32 November 13, 2014




AL103.2 Subfloor preparation.

A layer of gas-permeable material shall be plagedieu all concrete slabs and other floor
systems that directly contact the ground and atieinvihe walls of the living spaces of the
building, to facilitate future installation of alsslab depressurization system, if needed.
The gas-permeable layer shall consist of one ofat@wving_

1. A uniform layer of clean aggregate, a minimum ahdhes (102mm) thick. The
aggregate shall consist of material that will pssugh a 2-inch (51mm) sieve
and be retained by a 1/4-inch (6.4 mm) sieve.

2. A uniform layer of sand (native or fill ), @ minimuof 4 inches (102 mm) thick,
overlain by a layer or strips of geo-textile drgjaanatting designed to allow the
lateral flow of soil gases.

3. Other materials, systems or floor designs with destrated capability to permit
depressurization across the entire sub-floor area.

AL103.3 Soil-gas-retarder.

A minimum 6-mil (0.15 mm) [or 3-mil (0.075 mm) cefaminated] polyethylene or
equivalent flexible sheeting material shall be pthon top of the gas-permeable layer
prior to casting the slab or placing the floor assly to serve as a soil-gas-retarder by
bridging any cracks that develop in the slab ooiflassembly and to prevent concrete
from entering the void spaces in the aggregate tvagerial. The sheeting shall cover the
entire floor area with separate sections of shgdapped at least 12 inches (305 mm).
The sheeting shall fit closely around any pipeewar other penetrations of the material.
All punctures or tears in the material shall bdesttar covered with additional sheeting.

AL103.4 Entry routes.
Potential radon entry routes shall be closed inom@nce with Sections AF103.4.1
through AF103.4.10.

AL103.4.1 Floor openings.

Openings around bathtubs, showers, water closgtss wires or other objects that
penetrate concrete slabs or other floor assemdiiig be filled with a polyurethane
caulk or equivalent sealant applied in accordandth whe manufacturer's

recommendations.

AL103.4.2 Concrete joints.

All control joints, isolation joints, constructiojpints and any other joints in
concrete slabs or between slabs and foundatiors whHll be sealed with a caulk
or sealant. Gaps and joints shall be cleared ofdomaterial and filled with

polyurethane caulk or other elastomeric sealantiegppn accordance with the
manufacturer's recommendations.

AL103.4.3 Condensate drains.
Condensate drains shall be trapped or routed throwan-perforated pipe to
daylight.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 33 November 13, 2014




AL103.4.4 Sumps.

Sump pits open to soil or serving as the termimagioint for sub-slab or exterior
drain tile loops shall be covered with a gasketedtberwise sealed lid. Sumps
used as the suction point in a sub-slab depressianiz system shall have a lid
designed to accommodate the vent pipe. Sumps ssadlaor drain shall have a
lid equipped with a trapped inlet.

AL103.4.5 Foundation walls

Hollow block masonry foundation walls shall be donsted with either a
continuous course dafolid masonry, one course of masonry grouted solid, or a
solid concrete beam at or above finished grounthserto prevent passage of air
from the interior of the wall into the living spad&here a brick veneer or other
masonry ledge is installed, the course immediatefow that ledge shall be
sealed. Joints, cracks or other openings arounukaktrations of both exterior and
interior surfaces of masonry block or wood founalativalls below the ground
surface shall be filled with polyurethane caulkeguivalent sealant. Penetrations
of concrete walls shall be filled.

AL103.4.6

Damp proofing. The exterior surfaces of portions of concrete amdanry block
walls below the ground surface shall be damp pafeaccordance with Section
R406 of this code.

AL103.4.7 Air-handling units.
Air-handling units in crawl spaces shall be seatedrevent air from being drawn
into the unit.

Exception: Units with gasketed seams or units that are otlserwealed by the
manufacturer to prevent leakage.

AL103.4.8 Ducts.

Ductwork passing through or beneath a slab shabfleeamless material unless
the air-handling system is designed to maintairtioanus positive pressure within
such ducting. Joints in such ductwork shall be exkab prevent air leakage.
Ductwork located in crawl spaces shall have alireeand joints sealed by closure
systems in accordance with Section M1601.4.1.

AL103.4.9 Crawl space floors.
Openings around all penetrations through floorsvaborawl spaces shall be
caulked or otherwise filled to prevent air leakage.

AL103.4.10 Crawl space access
Access doors and other openings or penetratiomgekabasements and adjoining
crawl spaces shall be closed, gasketed or othefilesto prevent air leakage.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 34 November 13, 2014




AL103.5 Passive sub-membrane depressurization syste
In buildings with crawl space foundations the fallog components of as passive sub-
membrane depressurization system shall be instdilleédg construction.

Exception: Buildings in which arapproved mechanical crawl space ventilation system or
other equivalent system is installed.

AL103.5.1 Ventilation.

Crawl spaces shall be provided with vents to theerer of the building. The
minimum net area of ventilation openings shall cympith Section R408.1 of
this code.

AL103.5.2 Soil-gas-retarder.

The soil in crawl spaces shall be covered withraioaous layer of minimum 6-mil
(0.15 mm) polyethylene soil-gas-retarder. The gdowover shall be lapped a
minimum of 12 inches (305 mm) at joints and shateed to all foundation walls
enclosing the crawl space area.

AL103.5.3 Vent pipe.

A plumbing tee or othempproved connection shall be inserted horizontally
beneath the sheeting and connected to a 3- orddiaeneter (76 mm or 102 mm)
fitting with a vertical vent pipe installed throudiine sheeting. The vent pipe shall
be extended up through the building floors, terr@ret least 12 inches (305 mm)
above the roof in a location at least 10 feet (30¥8) away from any window or
other opening into theonditioned spaces of the building that is less than 2 feet
(610 mm) below the exhaust point, and 10 feet (30v8) from any window or
other opening in adjoining or adjacent buildings.

AL103.6 Passive sub-slab depressurization system.
In basement or slab-on-grade buildings, the following comporseot a passive sub-slab
depressurization system shall be installed durargstruction.

AL103.6.1 Vent pipe

A minimum3-inch-diameter (76 mm) ABS, PVC or equérd gastight pipe shall
be embedded vertically into the sub-slab aggregatether permeable material
before the slab is cast. A "T" fitting or equivalenethod shall be used to ensure
that the pipe opening remains within the sub-slabrmgable material.
Alternatively, the 3-inch (76 mm) pipe shall beearted directly into an interior
perimeter drain tile loop or through a sealed suwroper where the sump is
exposed to the sub-slab aggregate or connectéthtough a drainage system.

The pipe shall be extended up through the buildiogrs, terminate at least 12
inches (305 mm) above the surface of the roof liocation at least 10 feet (3048
mm) away from any window or other opening into toeditioned spaces of the
building that is less than 2 feet (610 mm) below #xhaust point, and 10 feet
(3048 mm) from any window or other opening in adjog or adjacent buildings.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 35 November 13, 2014




AL103.6.2 Multiple vent pipes.

In buildings where interior footings or other bars separate the sub-slab
aggregate or other gas-permeable material, each srall be fitted with an
individual vent pipe. Vent pipes shall connect tesiagle vent that terminates
above the roof or each individual vent pipe shatininate separately above the
roof

AL103.7 Vent pipe drainage.
All components of the radon vent pipe system sbhallinstalled to provide positive
drainage to the ground beneath the slab or soitgfasder.

AL103.8 Vent pipe accessibility.
Radon vent pipes shall be accessible for futureifatallation through aattic or other
area outside thleabitable space.

Exception: The radon vent pipe need not be accessible iatdm space where an
approved roof top electrical supply is provided for futureeu

AL103.9 Vent pipe identification.

All exposed and visible interior radon vent pipes shalidentified with at least one
label on each floor and in accessitdétics. The label shall read:"Radon Reduction
System."

AL103.10 Combination foundations.

Combinationbasement/ crawl space or slab-on-grade/crawl space foundstsirall
have separate radon vent pipes installed in eguoh ¢f foundation area. Each radon
vent pipe shall terminate above the roof or shallcbnnected to a single vent that
terminates above the roof.

AL103.11 Building depressurization.

Joints in air ducts and plenumsunconditioned spaces shall meet the requirements of
Section M1601. Thermal envelope air infiltratiomueéements shall comply with the

energy conservation provisions in Chapter 11. siopping shall meet the requirements
contained in Section R602.8.

AL103.12 Power source.

To provide for future installation of an active sm@embrane or sub-slab
depressurization system, an electrical circuit teated in anapproved box shall be
installed during construction in tfattic or other anticipated location of vent pipe fans.
An electrical supply shall also be accessible incgrated locations of system failure
alarms.

(f) Appendix M is added as follows:

APPENDIX M
WATER RESOURCE CONSERVATION MEASURES

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 36 November 13, 2014




This appendix adopts the International Green Cardton Code, Sections 701

and Section

702.1 - 702.6.

SECTION 701 GENERAL

701.1 Scope.

The provisions of this chapter shall establish riieans of conserving water, protecting
water quality and providing for safe water consuopt

SECTION 702 FIXTURES, FITTINGS, EQUIPMENT AND APPLI ANCES

702.1 Fitting and fixture consumption.
Fixtures shall comply with Table 702.1 and thedwaling:

1.

For dwelling unit and guestroom shower comparits with a floor area of
not greater than 26007r{1.7 nf), the combined flow rate from shower
water outlets that are capable of operating simebasly including rain
systems, waterfalls, body sprays and jets shallemoeed 2.0 gallons per
minute (gpm) (7.6 L/min). Where the floor area oaficls shower
compartments is greater than 2600 (.7 nf), the combined flow rate
from simultaneously operating shower water outi#all not exceed 2.0
gpm (7.6 L/min) for each additional 2600%il.7 nf) of floor area or
portion thereof.

In gang shower rooms, the combined flow ravenfshower water outlets
that are capable of operating simultaneously inolydrain systems,

waterfalls, body sprays and jets shall not exce@dgpm (7.6 L/min) for

every 1600 i (1.01 n%l or portion thereof of room floor area.

In shower compartments required to comply wtie requirements of
Chapter 11 of thénternational Building Code, the combined flow rate
from shower water outlets that are capable of dpegrasimultaneously
including rain systems, waterfalls, body sprays jet&lshall not exceed 4.0
gpm (15.1 L/min) for every 26004r(1.7 nf) or portion thereof of room
floor area.

TABLE 702.1 MAXIMUM FIXTURE AND FITTING FLOW RATES
FOR REDUCED WATER CONSUMPTION

FIXTURE OR FIXTURE FITTING TYPE MAXIMUM FLOW RATE

Showerheall

2.0 gpm and WaterSense
labeled

Lavatory faucet and bar sink—private 1.5 gpm

Lavatory faucet—public (metered) 0.25 §pc

Lavatory faucet—public (nonmetered) 0.5 gpm

ORDINANCE NO. ??2??

37 November 13, 2014




Kitchen faucet—private 2.2 gpm

Kitchen and bar sink faucets in other than dwelling U
and guestrooms

2.2 gpm

0.5 gpf and WaterSense

Urinal labeled or nonwater urinal
Water closet—public and remébte 1.6 gpf

Water closet—public and nonremote 1.28 gpf avérage
Water closet-tank type, private Ilai Sglggf and WaterSense
Water closet—flushometer type, private 1.28°gpf

Prerinse spray valves 1.3 gpm

Drinking fountains (manual) 0.7 gpm

Drinking fountains (metered) 0.25 dpc

For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm, 1 gallon per cycle (gp@.8 Lpc, 1 gallon per flush (gpf) = ¢

Lpf, 1 gallon per minute (gpm) = 3.8 Lpm.

a. Includes hand showers, body sprays, rainfall paaetkjets. Showerheads shal
supplied by automatic compensating valves that ¢pmjth ASSE 1016 or ASM

Al112.18.1/CSA B1283 and that are specifically designed to functioring flow
rate of the showerheads being used.

b. Gallons per cycle of water volume discharged fraacheactivation of a meter
faucet.
C. A remote water closet is a water closet locatedlesd than 30 feaipstream c

other drain line connections or fixtures and isated where less than 1.5 drain
fixture units are upstream of the drain line cortiogc

d. The effective flush volume for a dutlilish water closet is defined as the compc
average flush volume of two reduced flushes andfahéush.
e. In public settings, the maximum water use of a duedh water closet is bas

solely on its full flush operation; not an averagdull and reduced volume flushes.

702.2 Combination tub and shower valves.

Tub spout leakage from combination tub and shovedves that occurs when the outlet
flow is diverted to the shower shall not exceeddpin, measured in accordance with the
requirements of ASME A112.18.1/CSA B125.1.

702.3 Food establishment prerinse spray valves.
Food establishment prerinse spray valves shall bavaximum flow rate in accordance
with Table 702.1 and shall shut off automaticallyen released.

702.4 Drinking fountain controls.
Drinking fountains equipped with manually contrdllealves shall shut off automatically
upon the release of the valve. Metered drinkingnfains shall comply with the flow
volume specified in Table 702.1.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 38 November 13, 2014




702.5 Nonwater urinal connection.

The fixture drain for nonwater urinals shall conneca branch drain that serves one or
more lavatories, water closets or water-using Usinthat discharge upstream of such
urinals.

702.6 Appliances.
Sections 702.6.1 through 702.6.4 shall regulatdiapges that are not related to space
conditioning.

702.6.1 Clothes washers.

Clothes washers of the type in the ENERGY STAR oy as defined in
"ENERGY STAR® Program Requirements, Product Specification foott@ls
Washers, Eligibility Criteria,” shall have a watiactor (WF) not exceeding 6.0
and amodified energy factor (MEF) of not less than 2.0.

702.6.2 Ice makers.

Ice makers shall not be water cooled. Ice makerdyming cubed-type ice shall be
ENERGY STAR qualified as commercial ice machines. inakers of a type not
currently ENERGY STAR qualified, such as flake, gefgor continuous-type ice
makers, shall not exceed the total water use aj&@®ns per 100 pounds (208 L
per 100 kg) of ice produced.

702.6.3 Steam cookers.
Steam cookers shall consume not more than the asiandicated in Table
610.2.3.

702.6.4 Dishwashers.

Dishwashers shall be ENERGY STAR qualified where BMERGY STAR
category exists for the specific dishwasher typehew’¥ an ENERGY STAR
category does not exist, the dishwasher shall laedanrdance with Table 702.6.4.

TABLE 702.6.4 MAXIMUM WATER CONSUMPTION FOR
COMMERCIAL DISHWASHERS

DISHWASHER TYPE |MAXIMUM WATER CONSUMPTION
Rackless conveyor 2.2 gallons per minute

Utensil washer 2.2 gallons per rack

For Sl: 1 gallon per minute = 3.785 Lpm.

702.7 Municipal reclaimed water.
Delete this section in its entirety.

702.8 Efficient hot and tempered water distribution

Hot and tempered water distribution shall complyhvaither the maximum pipe length or

maximum pipe volume limits in this section. Hot @echpered water shall be delivered to
the outlets of individual showers, combination simwers, sinks, lavatories, dishwashers,

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 39 November 13, 2014




washing machines and hot water hose bibbs in aanoedwith Section 702.8.1 or Section
702.8.2. For purposes of this section, referenegspe shall include tubing. For purposes
of this section, the source of hot or tempered wakall be considered to be a water
heater, boiler, circulation loop piping or elecatig heat-traced piping.

702.8.1 Maximum allowable pipe length method.

The maximum allowable pipe length from the sourtéai or tempered water to
the termination of the fixture supply pipe shall be accordance with the
maximum pipe length columns in Table 702.8.2. Whheelength contains more
than one size of pipe, the largest size shall leel isr determining the maximum
allowable length of the pipe in Table 702.8.2.

702.8.2 Maximum allowable pipe volume method.

The water volume in the piping shall be calculatedaccordance with Section
702.8.2.1. The maximum volume of hot or temperetewia the piping to public
lavatory faucets, metering or nonmetering, shal? lmeinces (0.06 L). For fixtures
other than public lavatory faucets, the maximunuwawe shall be 64 ounces (1.89
L) for hot or tempered water from a water heatebaiter; and 24 ounces (0.7 L)
for hot or tempered water from a circulation logpepor an electrically heat-traced

pipe.
TABLE 702.8.2 MAXIMUM LENGTH OF PIPE OR TUBE

MAXIMUM PIPE OR TUBE LENGTH
System withoul{System with glLavatory faucets
LIQUID a circulation circulation — public
NOMINAL OUNCES PERIloop or heatjloop or heat{(metering and
PIPE OR TUBE|FOOT traced lingitraced linelnonmetering)
SIZE(inch) OF LENGTH |(feet) (feet) (feet)
Y2 0.33 50 16 6
*l16” 0.5 50 16 4
% 0.75 50 16 3
Y, 1.5 43 16 2
%l 2 32 12 1
%l 3 21 8 0.5
I 4 16 6 0.5
1 5 13 5 0.5
1Y, 8 8 3 0.5
1Y, 11 6 2 0.5
2 or larger 18 4 1 0.5

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm, 1 galper minute = 3.785 L/m,
ounce = 29.6 ml.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 40 November 13, 2014




a. The flow rate for'/s-inch siz pipe or tube is limited to 0.5 gallons
minute; for >s¢inch size, it is limited to 1 gpm; folfg-inch size, it i
limited to 1.5 gpm.

702.8.2.1 Water volume determination.

The volume shall be the sum of the internal voluroépipe, fittings, valves,
meters and manifolds between the source of hotrvesie the termination of the
fixture supply pipe. The volume shall be determifiedn the liquid ounces per
foot column of Table 702.8.2. The volume containgithin fixture shutoff valves,
flexible water supply connectors to a fixture figi or within a fixture fitting shall
not be included in the water volume determinatidhere hot or tempered water is
supplied by a circulation loop pipe or an electhiicheat-traced pipe, the volume
shall include the portion of the fitting on the soeipipe that supplies water to the
fixture.

702.9 Trap priming water. Delete this section in its entirety.

702.10 Water-powered pumps.

Water-powered pumps shall not be used as the primaans of removing ground water
from sumps. Where used as an emergency backup pomghe primary pump, the
primary pump shall be an electrically powered pusmg the water-powered pump shall
be equipped with an auditory alarm that indicatdgenvthe water-powered pump is
operating. The alarm shall have a minimum soundsune level rating of 85 dB measured
at a distance of 10 feet (3048 mm). Where watergved pumps are used, they shall have
a water-efficiency factor of pumping not less tl2agallons (7.6 L) of water to a height of
8 feet (2438 mm) for every 1 gallon (3.8 L) of watised to operate the pump, measured
at a water pressure of 60 psi (413.7 kPa). Pumal$ lsh clearly marked as to the gallons
(liters) of water pumped per gallon (liters) of loe water consumed.

702.11 Food service handwashing faucets.
Faucets for handwashing sinks in food service pegjwa and serving areas shall be of
the self-closing type.

702.12 Dipper wells.

The water supply to a dipper well shall have aatiwialve and flow control valve. Water
flow into a dipper well shall not exceed 1 gpm 8Lpm) at a supply pressure of 60 psi
(413.7 kPa).

702.13 Automated vehicle wash facilities.

Not less than 50 percent of the water used forrith@ng phase of the wash cycle at
automated vehicle wash facilities shall be colléd® be reused for the washing phase.
Towel and chamois washing machines shall have leighl- water cutoffs. Except for
water recirculated within the facility, potable andnpotable water use for automobile
washing shall not exceed 40 gallons (151 L) peiclelior in-bay automatic washing and
35 gallons (132.5 L) per vehicle for conveyor argdress-type car washing.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 41 November 13, 2014




Exception: Bus and large commercial vehicle washing facilities

702.14 Self-service vehicle wash facilities.
Spray wand nozzles used at self-service vehiclédvieslities shall discharge not more
than 3 gpm (11.4 Lpm). Faucets for chamois wringjaks shall be of the self-closing

type.

702.15 Vehicle washing facilities.
Waste water from reverse osmosis water treatmestesyg installed in vehicle washing
facilities shall discharge to the washing phaseemaplding tank.

702.16 Food waste disposers.

The water flow into a commercial food waste dispdeea food establishment shall be
controlled by a load-sensing device such that tatemflow does not exceed 1 gpm (3.78
Lpm) under no-load operating conditions and 8 gBthZ Lpm) under full-load operating
conditions.

702.17 Combination ovens.

Combination ovens shall consume not more than alergs (13.25 L) per hour per
steamer pan in any operational mode. Water consomphall be tested in accordance
with the requirements of ASTM F 1639.

702.18 Autoclaves and sterilizers.

Autoclaves and sterilizers requiring condensateptsing systems shall be of the type that
does not require potable water to be blended with discharge water to reduce the
temperature of discharge.

702.18.1 Vacuum autoclaves and sterilizers.
Vacuum sterilizers shall be prohibited from utiigi venturi-type vacuum
mechanisms using water.

702.19 Liquid ring vacuum pumps.
Except where the discharge is contaminated wittaftmzis materials or pathogens, the
discharge water from liquid ring vacuum pumps sballrecovered for reuse within the
pump or for other onsite applications.
702.20 Film processors.
The cooling water discharge from water-cooled fpnocessors shall be recovered and
reused within the processor or for other onsitdieajons.

15.04.020(B) Amendments to the International Resia¢ial Code are as follows:

€)) Section R101.1 Insert: [City of Ketchum, Idaho]

(b) Section 101.2 is amended as follows:

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 42 November 13, 2014




()

(d)

R101.2 - Scope.
Delete exception No. 1.

Delete exception No. 2, and replace with the foitmyv Owner-occupied lodging houses
with five (5) or fewer guestrooms shall be pernditte be constructed in accordance with
the International Residential Code for One- and -farily Dwellings.

Section R104.10.1 is amended to read as follows:

Section R104.10.1 Flood hazard areas. The building official shall not grant
modifications to any provision related to flood aet areas as established by Table
R301.2(1) without the granting of a variance tohsycovisions by the planning and
zoning commission.

Section 105.2 is amended to read as follows:

R105.2 Work exempt from permit.

Permits shall not be required for the following. Exemptifstom permit requirements of
this code shall not be deemed to grant authorizafito any work to be done in any
manner in violation of the provisions of this caateany other laws or ordinances of this
jurisdiction.

Building:

1. One-story detachedccessory structures used as tool and storage sheds,
playhouses and similar uses, provided the flooa @®es not exceed 200 square
feet (18.58 ).

2 Fences not over 6 feet (1829 mm) high.

3. Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet (1219) in height measured from the
bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, urdesipporting a surcharge.

4. Water tanks supported directly upgrmade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000
gallons (18 927 L) and the ratio of height to diéener width does not exceed 2 to

1.
5. Sidewalks and driveways.
6. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinetaunter tops and similar finish work.
7. Prefabricated swimming pools that are less #&mches (1219 mm) deep.
8. Swings and other playground equipment.
9. Window awnings supported by an exterior wallakhdo not project more than 54

inches (1372 mm) from the exterior wall and domegjuire additional support.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 43 November 13, 2014




10. Decks not exceeding 200 square feet (18 §dmarea, that are not more than 30
inches (762 mm) abowgrade at any point, are not attached talselling and do
not serve the exit door required Sgction R311.4.

11. Flag poles.
(e) Section R105.3.1.1 is amended to read as follows:

Section R105.3.1.1 Determination of substantiallymproved or substantially damaged
existing buildings in flood hazard areas.

For applications for reconstruction, rehabilitatiaddition or other improvement of existing
buildings or structures located in a flood hazaehas established by Table R301.2(1), the
building official shall require a floodplain development permit e provisions of Ketchum
Municipal Code, Section 17.88, Floodplain Managem@verlay Zoning District. For
buildings that have sustained damage of any oritje,value of the proposed work shall
include the cost to repair the building or struetto its predamaged condition. Applications
determined to constitute substantial improvemensurstantial damage shall require all
existing portions of the entire building or struettio meet the requirements®éction R322

() Section R108.2 is amended to read as follows:

R108.2 Schedule of permit fee©n buildings, structures, aiterations requiringa permit,
a fee for eaclpermit shall be paid as required, in accordance with thedule as set forth in
Table 1-A as established by resolution (#??7?) @y of Ketchum.

() Section R109.1.3 is amended to read as follows:

R109.1.3 Floodplain inspections.For construction in flood hazard areas as estadisly
Table R301.2(1), upon placement of the lowest floarludingbasement, and prior to further
vertical construction, thebuilding official shall require submission of documentation,
prepared and sealed by a licensed surveyor or engineer of the elevation of the lowest
floor, includingbasement, required inSection R322

(h) Section R112.2.1 is deleted in its entirety.

0] Section R112.2.2 is deleted in its entirety.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 44 November 13, 2014




()

Table R301.2.(l)

Insert:

WIND DESIGN SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM
GROUND SEISMIC WINTER |  ICE BARRIER FLOOD AIR MEAN
SNOW | speed® | '°P° | DESIGN | Frost .| DESIGN | UNDERLAYMENT | . oo | FREEZING | ANNUAL
LOAD | (mph) | 87PiC | cATEGORY' | Weathering” | line | Termite™ | gpjpe REQUIRED" INDEX' | TEMP!
effects depth
(a)
6/5/1978
: (b)
D, or per Sight to Not -
120psf | 90 No | IBCChap Severe | 2feet | Modera | Avail | Yo 24'inside | 11/26/2010 1 4y, a0F
16 te W wall line (c) 433,
434, 441,
442, 453,
461.

1. This Table also applies to IBC

(k)
()

(m)

(n)

ORDINANCE NO. ??2??

Section R301.2.2 is amended by eliminating the gkae in its entirety.

Section R301.2.2.2 is amended to read as follows:

R301.2.2.2 Seismic Design Category Structures assigned to Seismic Design Category

C shall conform to the requirements of this sectidlh structures including detached one
and two family structures in Seismic Design Catgg0ror greater shall have a lateral

force resisting system designed in accordance adttepted engineering practice. The

effective seismic weight for such buildings shaltlude 35% of the flat roof uniform
design snow load.

R301.2.4 Floodplain construction.
Buildings and structures constructed in whole opant in flood hazard areas (including
A or V Zones) as established in Table R301.2(1)l df&designed and constructed in
accordance wittSection R322Buildings and structures located in whole or artgn

identified floodways shall be designed and constdian accordance with ASCE 24 and
subject to the requirements of Ketchum Municipald€oChapter 17.88, Floodplain
Management Overlay Zoning Distict.

Section 301.2.4 is amended to read as follows:

Section R301.2.4.1 Alternative provisionelete this section in its entirety.

45

November 13, 2014




(0) Section R302.1, Table 302.1. Delete the figurethanlast column of the table under the
heading Minimum fire Separation Distance for thedl®” and “Projections” elements and
replace with the following:

Minimum Fire Separation Distance

Walls (fire-resistance rated): < Three (3) Feet

Walls (not fire-resistance rate®:Three (3) Feet

Projections (fire-resistance rated): < Three (3tFe

Projections (not fire-resistance rated)rhree (3) Feet

(p)  Section R302.2 is amended to read as follows:

R302.2 Townhouses.

Eachtownhouse shall be considered a separate building and slkealidparated by fire-
resistance-rated wall assemblies meeting the rexpeints ofSection R302.Tor exterior
walls.

Exception: A common 2-hour fire-resistance-rated wall assentbted in accordance

with ASTM E 119 or UL 263 is permitted for townhassif such walls do not contain

plumbing or mechanical equipment, ducts or venthéncavity of the common wall. The

wall shall be rated for fire exposure from bothesidcand shall extend to and be tight
against exterior walls and the underside of thé sbeathing. Electrical installations shall
be installed in accordance wihapters 34hrough43. Penetrations of electrical outlet

boxes shall be in accordance w&hction R302.4.

(q)  Section 302.3 is amended to read as follows:

R302.3 Two-family dwellings.

Dwelling units in two-family dwellings shall be separated fromleather by wall and/or
floor assemblies having not less than a 2-hourrésistance rating when tested in
accordance with ASTM E 119 or UL 263. Fire-resiseanated floor/ceiling and wall
assemblies shall extend to and be tight againsstiesor wall, and wall assemblies shall
extend from the foundation to the underside ofrtité sheathing.

Exceptions:
1. A fire-resistance rating df, hour shall be permitted in buildings equipped
throughout with an automatic sprinkler system ilestiin accordance with
NFPA 13.
2. Delete Exception 2 in its entirety.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 46 November 13, 2014




) Section R302.5.1 is amended as follows:

R302.5.1 Opening protection.

Openings from a private garage directly into a ragad for sleeping purposes shall not
be permitted. Other openings between the garageesidence shall be equipped with
solid wood doors not less than 13/8 inches (35 nmrthickness, solid or honeycomb
core steel doors not less than 13/8 inches (35 thith, or 20-minute fire-rated doors.
Doors shall be self-closing and self-latching.

(s) Section R309.3 shall be amended to read as follows:
R309.3 Flood hazard areas.

For buildings located in flood hazard areas asbéisteed by Table R301.2(1), garage
floors shall be:

1. Elevated to a minimum of 24 inches measured ftbentop of the slab
above the design flood elevation as determinea@ti@ R322; or

2. Located below the design flood elevation providedy are at or above
grade on at least one side, are used solely for parkmgding access or
storage, meet the requirements of Section R324 ared otherwise
constructed in accordance with this code and tlowigions of Ketchum
Municipal Code, Chapter 17.88, Floodplain Managean@werlay Zoning
District.

® Section R313.2 is deleted in its entirety:
R313.2 Design and installation.Delete in its entirety.
(u) Section 315.3 shall be amended to read as follows:

R315.3 Where required in existing dwellings.

Where work requiring @ermit occurs in existinglwellings that have attached garages or in
existing dwellings within which fuel-firedppliances exist, carbon monoxide alarms shall be
provided in accordance witection R315.1..

Exceptions:

1. Work involving the exterior surfaces of dwellingsuch as, but not limited to,
replacement of roofing or siding, or the additiarr@placement of windows or doors,
or the addition of a porch or deck or electricarnpiés, are exempt from the
requirements of this section.

2. Installation, alteration or repairs of noncombustumbing or mechanical systems
are exempt from the requirements of this section.

(v) The following sections 0fR322 FLOOD RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION shall be

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 47 November 13, 2014




amended to read as follows:

R322.1 General.

Buildings and structures constructed in whole goant in flood hazard areas (including A
or V Zones) as established in Table R301.2(1) sballdesigned and constructed in
accordance with the provisions contained in thidise and the provisions of Ketchum
Municipal Code, Chapter 17.88, Floodplain Managem@verlay Zoning District.
Buildings and structures located in whole or intparidentified floodways shall be
designed and constructed in accordance with ASCE 24

R322.1.6 Protection of mechanical and electrical siems.
Exception: Delete in its entirety.

R322.2.1 Elevation requirements.

1. Buildings and structures in flood hazard amatsdesignated as Coastal A Zones
shall have the lowest floors elevated to a minimafrtwo feet-er above the design
flood elevation and shall meet the provisions ofcdkem Municipal Code, Chapter
17.88, Floodplain Management Overlay Zoning Distric

2. Buildings and structures in flood hazard assignated as Coastal A Zones shall
meet the provisions of Ketchum Municipal Code, Ghapl7.88, Floodplain
Management Overlay Zoning District have the lowesirs elevated to or above
the base flood elevation plus 1 foot (305 mm), mthe design flood elevation,
whichever is higher.

3. In areas of shallow flooding (AO Zones), builgk and structures shall have the
lowest floor (includingbasement) elevated at least as high two feet above the
highest adjacengrade as the depth number specified in feet on the FlRMat
least 2 feet (610 mm) if a depth number is not ifipec

4. Basement floors that are belgrade on all sides shall be elevated to or above the
design flood elevation or meet the provisions oftdéem Municipal Code,
Chapter 17.88, Floodplain Management Overlay Zobirggrict.

Exception: Enclosed areas below the design flood elevatiaiyding basements
whose floors are not belograde on all sides, shall meet the requirements of
Section R322.2.2.

R322.2.2 Enclosed area below design flood elevation

Enclosed areas, including crawl spaces, that al@vbthe design flood elevation shall
meet the provisions of Ketchum Municipal Code, Ghai7.88, Floodplain Management
Overlay Zoning District and shall:

(w)  Section R325 is added to read as follows:

R325 Class A Roof Assemblies RequiredClass A roof assemblies with no wood

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 48 November 13, 2014




products in the roof covering are required on alvrbuildings. Class A roof assemblies
with no wood products in roof covering are requifedall re-roofs over 3,000 square feet
of roof area. Class A is not required when less tlwgenty-five (25) percent of the roof
area is being repaired and additional areas aresutmgequently repaired within five (5)
years. Additions to buildings over 1,000 square téeoof area require that the roof of the
entire building be upgraded to a Class A roof asdemvith no wood products in the roof
covering.

(x) Section R602.10 is amended to read as follows:

R602.10 Wall bracing.

Buildings shall be braced in accordance with th@stisn or, when applicabl&ection
R602.12,0r the most current edition of APA Sustem Reportl®R as an alternate
method. Where a building, or portion thereof, does comply with one or more of the
bracing requirements in this section, those postisimall be designed and constructed in
accordance witlsection R301.1.

(y) Section R1005.3.1 is added to read as Section M8A%5ection 4 of this Ordinance.
15.04.020(E) Amendments to the International EnesgConservation Code

€)) Section IECC101.1 Insert: [City of Ketchum, Idaho]
(b) Add Section C404.8 to read as follows:

Section C404.8. Commercial snow melt systems. (Ndatory)

C404.8.1. Scope
This section applies to snow melt systems largam 80 square feet in heated area.

C404.8.2. Energy offset requirements.

Energy use for snow melt systems larger than 5@rsdfieet in heated area shall be
offset by production a minimum of the equivalentoamt of renewable energy
produced on site. Calculations showing energy waipsgion of the snow melt
system and the minimum equivalent energy produatibthe renewable energy
system shall be prepared a by qualified professiand submitted as part of the
building permit application.

Exception: Snow melt systems required by the Fire Departrfaarsafety reasons
shall not require an equivalent renewable enerfgebff conditions at the subject
site preclude installation of said renewable enesgstem, as determined by a
qualified renewable energy professional and apptawe the building official.
However, every effort shall be made to offset astmaf the exterior energy use of
the snow melt system as possible on site.

C404.8.3 System requirements.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 49 November 13, 2014




4.

Insulate below and perimeter with minimum R-10 cfinsal insulation or
radiant foil system;

Minimum 92% efficiency boiler or Energy Star heatyp;

Automated controls capable of shutting off the sysivhen the pavement
temperature is above 58 and no precipitation is falling and an automatic
or manual control that will allow shutoff when tbatdoor temperature is
above 40F;

Positive drainage off driveway. (Use geofabric empgavers.)

(c) Amend Section R403.8 to read as follows:

Section R403.8. Residential snow melt systems. ghtdatory)

R403.8.1. Scope
This section applies to snow melt systems largam 80 square feet in heated area.

R403.8.2. Energy offset requirements.

Energy use for snow melt systems larger than 5@rsdfieet in heated area shall be
offset by production a minimum of the equivalentoamt of renewable energy
produced on site. Calculations showing energy wapsgion of the snow melt
system and the minimum equivalent energy produatibthe renewable energy
system shall be prepared a by qualified professiand submitted as part of the
building permit application.

Exception. Snow melt systems required by the Fire Departrfeersafety reasons
shall not require an equivalent renewable enerfgebff conditions at the subject
site preclude installation of said renewable enesgstem, as determined by a
gualified renewable energy professional and apptawe the building official.
However, every effort shall be made to offset astmof the exterior energy use of
the snow melt system as possible on site.

R403.8.3 System requirements.

5.

ORDINANCE NO. ??2??

Insulate below and perimeter with minimum R-10 cfnsal insulation or
radiant foil system;

Minimum 92% efficiency boiler or Energy Star heatyp;

Automated controls capable of shutting off the sysivhen the pavement
temperature is above 58 and no precipitation is falling and an automatic
or manual control that will allow shutoff when tbatdoor temperature is
above 40F;

Positive drainage off driveway. (Use geofabric empgavers.)

50 November 13, 2014




15.04.020(F) Amendments to the International Existg Building Code
€)) Section IEBC101.1 Insert: [City of Ketchum, Idaho]
(b) Section IEBC 409.1 is amended to read as follows:

409.1 Conformance.Structures moved into or within the jurisdictionaiftbe evaluated
by a registered engineer and shall comply with phnevisions of thelnternational
Building Code for new structures as amended by the City of Katthu

(c) Section IEBC [B] 1302.3 Exceptions are amenaeébllows.

1302.3 Wind loads.

Buildings shall be evaluated by a registered ergginend shall comply with the
International Building Code or International Residential Code wind provisions as
applicable and as amended by the City of Ketchum.

Exceptions:

1. Structural elements whose stress is withindri@gnt of allowable stresses for new
materials designed to current code provisions.

(d) Section IEBC [B] 1302.4 is amended by revisihg section to read as follows and
deleting Exception 2.

1302.4 Seismic loads.

Buildings shall be evaluated by a registered ergginend shall comply with the
International Building Code or International Residential Code seismic provisions as
applicable and as amended by the City of Ketchutheahew location.

Exceptions:

1. Structural elements whose stress is within dr@gnt of allowable stresses for new
materials designed to current code provisions.

(e) Section [B] IEBC 1302.5 is amended to reafblisws and the exception to Section [B]
IEBC 1302.5 is deleted:

1302.5 Snow Loads.

Structures shall be evaluated by a registered eegirand shall comply with the
International Building Code or International Residential Code seismic provisions as
applicable and as amended by the City of Ketchum.

) Section [B] IEBC 1401.2 Insert: [January 1, 1975]

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 51 November 13, 2014




15.04.020(G) Amendments to the International Propé¢y Maintenance Code

€)) Section IPMC 101.1 Insert: [City of Ketchumalb]

(b) Section IPMC 103.5 is amended to read as follows:

103.5 Fees.
The fees for activities and services performed gy tepartment in carrying out its
responsibilities under this code shall be estabtidby resolution of the City of Ketchum.

Section 3.That Section 15.04.030 of the Ketchum Municipal €o@riminal Violation
and Penalty and Civil Enforcement, is hereby regdaa its entirety with the following:

(@  Any person, firm, association, or corporatibat fails to comply with or violates any of
these regulations or adopted codes shall be goiileymisdemeanor and upon conviction
shall be subject to a fine of not more than OneuBaad ($1000.00) or imprisonment for
a period not to exceed six (6) months, or both hikay that said violation continues shall
be considered a separate offense.

(b)  Appropriate actions and proceedings at launaequity may be instituted by the City of
Ketchum to restrain or abate violations of this i@atice or adopted codes, or compel
compliance herewith, or to prevent illegal condifiare or occupancy of any buildings,
structures, or premises in violation of this Ordioa or adopted codes together with
appropriate damages therefore. These remediesk#halimulative and in addition to all
other legal remedies and penalties provided by law.

Section 4  SAVINGS AND SEVERABILITY CLAUSE. It is hereby declared to be
the legislative intent that the provisions and pat this Ordinance shall be severable. If any
paragraph, part, section, subsection, sentenceelauphrase of this Ordinance is for any reason
held to be invalid for any reason by a Court of petent jurisdiction, such decision shall not
affect the validity of the remaining portions ofsi©rdinance.

Section 5. _CODIFICATION CLAUSE. The City Clerk is instructed to immediately
forward this ordinance to the codifier of the oficmunicipal code for proper revision of the
code.

Section 6. REPEALER CLAUSEAII City of Ketchum Ordinances or resolutions
or parts thereof which are in conflict herewith hezeby repealed,

Section?. PUBLICATION. This Ordinance, or a summary thereof in compliance
with Section 50-901A, Idaho Code, substantiallyhie form annexed hereto as Exhibit "A," shall
be published once in the official newspaper ofGlitg, and shall take effect immediately upon its
passage, approval, and publication.

Section 8. EFFECTIVE DATE.This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect
upon the date of its publication as provided by Velwch is

ORDINANCE NO. pr?? 52 November 13, 2014




PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF KETCHUMIDAHO, and
approved by the Mayor this ___ day of , 20

CITY OF KETCHUM, IDAHO

Nina Jonas, Mayor

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM
AND CONTENT:

Sandra E. Cady, CMC Stephanie J. Bonney,
City Treasurer/Clerk Legal Counsel

ORDINANCE NO. ??2?? 53 November 13, 2014




